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Jay A. Jaffe Named Co-Chair of Environmental
Department at Greenbaum, Rowe, Smith & Davis LLP
June 1, 2018
 

Greenbaum, Rowe, Smith & Davis LLP is pleased to announce that Jay A. Jaffe has been named Co-Chair
of the firm’s Environmental Department, effective June 1, 2018.

Mr. Jaffe joins David B. Farer in leading the department. Mr. Farer, who has chaired the environmental
group since joining the firm in 2012, will now serve as Co-Chair. He comments: “This is a well-deserved
honor and responsibility for an outstanding lawyer and colleague. Through the three decades that we’ve
worked side-by-side as environmental lawyers, Jay Jaffe has displayed all of the best traits of a counselor,
advocate, teammate, manager and friend.”

Commenting on his new role, Mr. Jaffe adds: “I am excited to be co-chairing the firm’s Environmental
Department with David Farer. It’s my privilege to be part of this special team of highly talented lawyers
providing counseling, advice and assistance to business clients facing complex environmental issues and
challenges.”

Mr. Jaffe, who joined the firm as a partner in 2012, represents developers, property and business owners,
landlords and tenants, manufacturers and other clients on a broad range of environmental legal issues. He
is highly knowledgeable regarding issues associated with the acquisition, cleanup and redevelopment of
contaminated properties and brownfield sites, including the negotiation of environmental provisions in
transactional documents and the coordination of environmental due diligence investigations. Mr. Jaffe
represents clients in negotiations with federal and state regulatory agencies and advises on potential cost
recovery options. He assists clients in the evaluation, allocation and avoidance of liabilities under federal
and state environmental laws, including New Jersey’s ISRA statute and Spill Act, the federal CERCLA
statute, and requirements under New Jersey’s Site Remediation Reform Act and LSRP program. He also
provides guidance on environmental conditions pertaining to the management of commercial properties,
such as asbestos, mold and vapor intrusion.


